Required logbook entries for instruction given


• 
FAR 61.189: You must sign the logbook of each person to whom you give flight and/or ground training


• 
Specify in that logbook the amount of instruction time, and date on which it was given


• 
Normally the following data are recorded in the students logbook:


1.  
Date


2.  
Airplane make and model


3.  
Airplane identification number


4.  
Total time of flight


5.  
Place or points of departure and arrival


6.  
Type of pilot experience or training


7.  
Conditions of flight

Recreational Pilot endorsements


1.  
 Endorsement for a recreational pilot to act as PIC on a flight that exceeds 50 NM from the departure airport: FAR 61.101 (c)


• 
I certify that - (name) has received the required crosscountry training of Sec. 61. 101(c). I have determined that helshe is proficient in cross-country flying of Subpart E of Part 61.


1.  
Endorsement for a recreational pilot to conduct solo flights for the purpose of obtaining an additional certificate or rating while under the supervision of an authorized flight instructor: FAR61.101(i)


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.87 in (make and model aircraft) I have determined Is that he/she prepared to conduct a solo flight on (date) under the following conditions: (List all conditions which require endorsement, e.g., flight which requires communication with ATC, flight in an aircraft for which the pilot does not hold category/class rating, etc.).

The following are logbook endorsements for specialized instruction:


1.  
Endorsement for a pilot to act as PIC in a complex airplane (an airplane that has a retractable landing gear, flaps, and a controllable pitch propeller): FAR 61.31 (e)


• 
I certify that (name, pilot certificate) has received the required training of Sec. 61.31 (e) in a (Make and model) complex airplane . I have determined that he/she is proficient in the operation and systems of a complex airplane.


1.  
Endorsement for a pilot to act as PIC in a high-performance airplane (an airplane with an engine of more than 200 horsepower): FAR 61.31 (a)


• 
I certify that (name) has receive the required training of Sec. 61.31 (f) in a (Make and model of high-performance airplane) . I have determined that he/she is proficient in the operation and systems of a high-performance airplane.


1.  
Endorsement to act as PIC in a pressurized aircraft capable of high-altitude operations: FAR 61.31 (g)


• 
I certify that (name, pilot certificate) has received the required training of Sec. 61.31 (g) in a (make and model). I have determined that he/she is proficient in the operation and systems of a pressurized aircraft.


1.  
Endorsement for a pilot to act as PIC in an airplane for which the FAA requires type-specific training: FAR 61.31 (i)


• 
I certify that I have given Mr/Ms. (name) type-specific training in a (make and model aircraft) and find him/her proficient in the operation of the aircraft and its systems.


1.  
Endorsement for a pilot to act as PIC in a tailwheel airplane: FAR 61.31 (i)


• 
I certify that (First name, MI. Last name , (Pilot -Certificate) (certificate number) has received the required training of Sec. 61.31 (1) in (make and model of tailwheel airplane). I have determined that he/she is proficient in the operation of a tailwheel airplane.

 


1.  
Endorsement for a pilot who does not hold an appropriate category/class rating to act as PIC of an aircraft in solo operations: FAR 61.31 (d)(3)


• 
I certify that (First name, MI. Last name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.31 (d) (3) to serve as a PIC in a (category and class of aircraft). I have determined that he/she is prepared to serve as PIC in that (Make and model of aircraft.


1.  
Endorsement for completing a phase of the WINGS Program: FAR 61.56(e)


• 
I certify that (Name, Pilot-certificate) certificate number has satisfactorily completed (Phase No.) of a WINGS program on

 (date).

 

 

Required student pilot certificate endorsements, including appropriate logbook entries

Student pilot certificates provide for CFI endorsements on the back of the certificate


1.  
The student pilot certificate must be endorsed prior to solo in each make and model


2.  
The student pilot certificate must be endorsed prior to the first solo cross-country flight in each category of aircraft

 The student pilot logbook must also be endorsed for solo flight


1.  
Endorsement for pre-solo aeronautical knowledge: FAR 61.87(b)


• 
Mr./Ms. (name) has satisfactorily completed a presolo written examination demonstrating knowledge of the portions of 14 CFR Parts 61 and 91 applicable to student pilots, and the flight characteristics and operational limitations for a (make & model) aircraft.


1.  
Endorsement for pre-solo flight training: FAR 61.87(c)


• 
I have given Mr./Ms. (name) the flight instruction required by 14 CFR 61.87(c) in a (make & model aircraft) He/She has demonstrated proficiency in the applicable maneuvers and procedures listed in 14 CFR Part 61.87(d) and is competent to make safe solo flights in a (make & model) airplane


1.  
Endorsement for solo flight (each additional 90-day period): FAR 61.87(n)


• 
I have given Mr./Ms. (Name) the instruction required by 14 CFR 61.87(n). He/She has met the requirements of 14 CFR 61.87(n) and is competent to make safe solo flights in a (make & model aircraft)


1.  
Endorsement for solo landings and takeoffs at another airport within 25 NM: FAR 61.93(b)(1)


• 
I have flown with Mr./Ms. (Name) and find him/her competent and proficient to practice landings and takeoffs at the (airport name) airport. Landings & takeoffs at (airport) are authorized subject to the following conditions: (list conditions)


1.  
Endorsement for solo flight at night: FAR 61.87(c) and (m)


• 
 I certify that (NAME) has received the required pre-solo training in a (Make and Model). I have determined that he/she has demonstrated the proficiency of FAR 61.87 (c) and (m) and is proficient to make solo flights at night

Student pilot logbooks must be endorsed for solo cross-country flight


1.  
Endorsement for solo cross-country flight training: FAR 61.93(c)(1)


• 
I certify that (NAME) has received the required solo cross-country training. I find that he/she has met the applicable requirements of Sec. 61.93(c)(1) and is proficient to make solo cross-country flights in a (make & model) airplane


1.  
Endorsement for each solo cross-country flight: FAR 61.93(c)(2)


• 
I have reviewed the preflight planning and preparations of Mr./Ms. (Name) and attest that he/she is prepared to make the solo at (names of applicable airports) in a (make & model) airplane on (date)


1.  
Endorsement for repeated solo cross-country flights not more than 50NM from the point of departure: FAR 61.93(c)(2)


• 
have given Mr./Ms. (Name) flight instruction in both directions over the route between (airport) and (airport), including takeoffs and landings at the airports to be used, and find him/her competent to conduct repeated solo flight over that route, subject to the following conditions: (list applicable conditions)

Student pilot logbooks must be endorsed for solo flight in class B airspace


1.  
Endorsement for solo flight in class B airspace: FAR 61.95(a)


• 
I have given Mr./Ms. (Name) the ground and flight instruction required by FAR 61.95(a), and find him/her competent to conduct solo flight in the (name of Class B) Class B airspace.


1.  
Endorsement for solo flight to, from, or at an airport located within class B airspace: FAR 61.95(a) and 91.131(b)(1)


• 
I have given Mr./Ms. (Name) the ground and flight instruction required by 14 CFR 61.95(a) and 91.131(b)(1), and find him/her competent to conduct solo operations at (name of airport)

Preparation of a recommendation for a pilot practical test, including appropriate logbook entry


• 
You and your student must complete and sign FAA Form 8710-1, Application Certificate and/or Rating Application, which is given to the FAA inspector/examiner at the practical test


• 
A practical test, whether passes or not, uses up the instructor's endorsement for that test


• 
A new FAA Form 8710-1 is required to be completed for each retest conducted for a certificate or rating


• 
The endorsement for flight proficiency must be in the applicant's logbook and presented to the FAA inspector/examiner at the practical test

 

 

 

The following are examples of endorsements for flight proficiency (i.e., for the practical test)


1.  
Recreational pilot: Endorsement for flight proficiency/practical test: FAR61.96(b)(5), 61.98(a) and (b), and 61.99


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.96(b) and 61.99. I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name the Practical test)


1.  
Private pilot: endorsement for flight proficiency/practical test: FAR 61.103(f), 61.107(b), and 61.109


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.107 and 61.109. I have determined he/she is prepared for the (name the practical test).


1.  
Commercial pilot: endorsement for flight proficiency (practical test): FAR 61.123(e) and 61.127


• 
I certify that ( name ) has received the required training of Sec. 61.127 and 61.129. I have determined he/she is prepared for the (name the practical test)


1.  
Flight instructor: endorsement for fundamentals of instructing: FAR 61.183(d) and 61.185(a)(1)


• 
I certify that ( name) has received the required FOI training of Sec. 61.185(a)(1)


1.  
Flight instructor: endorsement for flight proficiency/practical test: FAR 61.183(g) and 61.187(a) and (b)


• 
I certify that ( name ) has received the required training of Sec. 61.187(b). I have determined he/she is prepared for the CFI (aircraft category and class) practical test.

 

 


1.  
Endorsement for spin training: FAR 61.183(i)(1)


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.183(i). I have determined that he/she is competent and proficient on instructional skills for training stall awareness, spin entry, spins, and spin recovery procedures.


1.  
Endorsement for CFII rating/practical test: FAR 61.183(g) and 61.187(a) and (b)(7)


• 
I certify that ( name) has received the required CFII training of Sec. 61.187(b)(7). I have determined he/she is prepared for the CFII (airplane helicopter, or powered-Lift) practical test


1.  
Endorsement for re-testing after a failure of a knowledge or practical test: FAR 61.49.


• 
I certify that (name) has received the additional law and/or ground) training as required by Sec. 61.49. I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name the knowledge/practical test)

Additional aircraft or type ratings


1.  
Endorsement for an airman seeking an additional aircraft rating (other than ATP): FAR 61.63(b) or (c)


• 
I certify that (name) pilot certificate (certificate number) has received the required training for an additional (game the aircraft category/class rating) I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name the practical test for the addition of a (name the aircraft category/class rating).


1.  
Endorsement for a type rating only; the pilot already holds the appropriate category or class rating (other than ATP): FAR 61.63(d)(2) and (3)


• 
I certify that (First name, MI. Last name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.63(d)(2) and (3) for an addition of (name the type rating)


1.  
Endorsement for a type rating concurrently with an additional category or class rating (other than ATP): FAR 61.63(d)(2) and (3)


• 
I certify that ( name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.63(d) (2) and (3) for an addition of a (name the category/class/type rating I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name the practical test for the addition of and name the aircraft category/class/type rating).


1.  
Endorsement for a type rating only; the pilot already holds the appropriate category or class rating (at the ATP): level): FAR 61.157(b)(2)


• 
I certify that (First name, MI. Last name has received the required training of Sec. 61.157(b) (1) for an addition of a (name the rating).


1.  
Endorsement for a type rating concurrently with an additional category or class rating (at the ATP level): FAR 61.157(b)(2)


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.157(b)(1) for an addition of a ( category/class/type)

The following are examples of endorsements for aeronautical knowledge (pilot knowledge test)


1.  
Recreational pilot Endorsement for aeronautical knowledge test: FAR 61.35(a)(1) and 61.96(b) (3)


• 
I certify that (name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.97(b). I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name the knowledge test).


1.  
Private pilot Endorsement for aeronautical knowledge test: FAR61.35(a)(1), 61.103(d), and 61.105


• 
I certify that ( name) has received the required training of Sec. 61.105. I have determined he/she is prepared for the (name the knowledge test)


1.  
Commercial pilot endorsement for aeronautical knowledge test: FAR 61.35(a)(1) and 61.123(c)


• 
I certify that ( name ) has received the required training of Sec. 61.125, I have determined that he/she is prepared for the (name of the knowledge test)


1.  
Review of a home study curriculum: FAR 61.35(a)(1)


• 
I certify that / have reviewed the home study curriculum of ( name ) . I have determined he/she is prepared for the (name of the knowledge test)


1.  
Endorsement for a ground instructor who does not meet the recent experience requirements: FAR 61.217(b)


• 
I certify that ( name ) has demonstrated satisfactory proficiency on the appropriate ground instructor knowledge and training subjects of Sec. 61.213(a)(3) and (4).

Required endorsement of a pilot logbook for the satisfactory completion of the required FAA flight review


1.  
Endorsement for completion of flight review: FAR 61.56(a) and (c)


• 
I certify that (First name, MI, Last name) pilot certificate (certificate number) has satisfactorily completed a flight review of Sec. 61.56(a) on (date).

 

Required flight instructor records

You are required to maintain a record in your flight instructor logbook or in a separate document containing the following:


1.  
The name of each person whose logbook or student pilot certificate you endorsed for solo flight privileges, including the type and date of each endorsement


2.  
The name of each person you have signed off to take a knowledge or practical test including the kind of test, the date, and the result of the test


• 
These records must be retained for a period of 3 years

